

Line #	2021 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR SEDANS			BAXTER CDJRF OF LINCOLN		HUSKER AUTO GROUP LLC		SID DILLON CHEVROLET BUICK	
	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UOM	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST
1	2021 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR COMPACT 4 DOOR SEDANS FFV E85	51	EA	NO BID		NO-BID	NO-BID	NO BID	
	E85=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL MIXTURE OF UP TO 85% ETHANOL/15% UNLEADED GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL CHANGE OR CONVERSION								
	A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF BIDDING ALTERNATIVE FUEL VEHICLES. A SEPARATE CONTRACT MAY BE AWARDED.								
	WHEELBASE: MINIMUM OF 107", MAXIMUM OF 113"								
	LENGTH: MINIMUM OF 188", MAXIMUM OF 195"								
	MINIMUM TIRE SIZE: 16"								
	MAKE:			NO BID		NO-BID			
	MODEL:								
	SERIES, CODE TRIM LEVEL:								
	ENGINE (MINIMUM OF 1.5L I4):								
	EPA/MPG:								
	DELIVERY ARO:								
	MSRP \$:								
2	2021 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR COMPACT 4 DOOR SEDANS E15 COMPLIANT	51	EA	NO BID		\$ 17,999.00	\$ 917,949.00	\$ 17,633.00	\$ 899,283.00
	E85=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL MIXTURE OF UP TO 85% ETHANOL/15% UNLEADED GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL CHANGE OR CONVERSION								
	A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF BIDDING ALTERNATIVE FUEL VEHICLES. A SEPARATE CONTRACT MAY BE AWARDED.								
	WHEELBASE: MINIMUM OF 107", MAXIMUM OF 113"								
	LENGTH: MINIMUM OF 188", MAXIMUM OF 195"								
	MINIMUM TIRE SIZE: 16"								
	MAKE:			NO BID		CHEVROLET		CHEVROLET	
	MODEL:					MALIBU		MALIBU	
	SERIES, CODE TRIM LEVEL:					COMPACT, 1ZC69, FLT LS IFL		1ZC69 LS	
	ENGINE (MINIMUM OF 1.5L I4):					1.5 TURBO DOHC 4-CYLINDER		1.5L	
	EPA/MPG:					36 H / 29 C		29 CITY-36 HWY	
	DELIVERY ARO:					35/120 DAYS		40-120	
	MSRP \$:					\$ 24,201.25		\$ 24,161.00	

THE OPTIONS SHALL MEET OR EXCEED THE FOLLOWING REQUIREMENTS THAT ARE EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATION AND MUST BE FACTORY INSTALLED UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED IN SPECIFICATION. QUOTES MUST BE FURNISHED FOR ITEMS LISTED BELOW IF NOT INCLUDED AS STANDARD EQUIPMENT OR REQUIRED IN MAIN PART OF THIS SPECIFICATION.									
3	ENGINE (OTHER) SPECIFY ENGINE SIZE:	51	EA	NO BID		NA	NA	NA	NA
4	HEAVY DUTY BENCH FRONT SEAT	51	EA			NA	NA	NA	NA
5	HEAVY DUTY SPLIT FRONT SEAT	51	EA			NA	NA	NA	NA
6	HEAVY DUTY POWER SPLIT FRONT SEATS	51	EA			DRIVERS ONLY & BUCKET SEATS \$ 400.00 \$ 20,400.00		\$ 400.00	
7	LUMBAR SUPPORT FRONT SEATS (IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)	51	EA			DRIVERS ONLY & REQUIRES AE8 PKG \$ 400.00 \$ 20,400.00		\$ 400.00	
8	FULL-SIZE SPARE TIRE (RIM MAY BE STEEL)	51	EA			NA	NA		
9	KEYLESS REMOTE ENTRY (INCLUDES TWO (2) FOBS TO ENTER THE VEHICLE)	51	EA			STD	STD	INCL	
10	ADDITIONAL FOB (IF EQUIPPED WITH KEYLESS REMOTE ENTRY)	51	EA			\$ 199.00	\$ 10,149.00	\$ 149.00	
11	STANDARD PAINT (ATTACH NO ADDITIONAL COST PAINTS LIST)	51	EA			SEE ATTACHED	SEE ATTACHED CHART	SEE ATTACHED	
12	EXTRA COST PAINT (ATTACH EXTRA COST PAINTS LIST)	51	EA			NA	NA	NA	
13	ALL WHEEL DRIVE (AWD)	51	EA			NA	NA	NA	
14	REVERSE SENSING SYSTEM	51	EA			REQUIRES-WPR DRIVERS CONVENCE PKG \$ 545.00 \$ 27,795.00		DEALER INSTALLED \$ 433.00	
15	REAR VISION CAMERA (IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)	51	EA			STD	STD	INCL	
16	ADDITIONAL MANUFACTURER WARRANTY COST(S) SPECIFY YEARS AND MILES:	51	EA			5 YEAR/100,000 MILE PWR TRAIN, 5 YEAR/100,000 MILE ROADSIDE ASSTN -FLEET ONLY NC NC		CALL FOR OPTIONS	

17	PROTECTIVE VINYL BODY MOLDING (DEALER INSTALLED IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)	51	EA			DLR INSTALLED		\$ 350.00	
						\$ 397.00	\$ 20,247.00		
18	DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES OUTSIDE THE LINCOLN AREA (DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES APPLY TO VEHICLES PURCHASED BY POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS AND OTHER DIVISIONS OF GOVERNMENT)	51	EA			\$ 500.00	\$ 25,500.00	\$ 400.00	
Payment Terms:						0 30		0 30	
Delivery Days ARO:				120		35/120		30-120	
Comments:									